
Privacy Policy 

 

1. Information We Gather From Visitors 
As with other websites, log files may be stored on the web server saving information such as the visitor's 
IP address, browser type, referring page and time of visit. Cookies may be used to remember visitor 
preferences when interacting with the website. Where registration is required, the visitor's email and a 
username may be stored on the server. When a visitor purchases a product or service, the visitor's 
personal and financial information may be stored on the server. 

2. How The Information Is Used 
The information may be used to enhance the visitors experience by displaying personalized content and 
possibly advertising. We may email and/or text message you from time to time in the normal course of 
business. Your email address and/or phone number will not be sold, rented or leased to 3rd parties. 
Marketing email and/or text messages may be sent to inform you of news, new services or offers by us 
or our affiliates. 

3. Visitor Options 
If you have subscribed to one of our services, you may unsubscribe by following the instructions which 
are included in email and/or text message that you receive. You may also be able to block cookies via 
your browser settings, but this may prevent you from access to certain features of the website. 

4. Cookies 
Small digital signature files (cookies) may be stored by your web browser that allow your preferences to 
be recorded when visiting the website. Also, they may be used to track your return visits to the website. 
3rd party advertisers may also use cookies for tracking purposes. 

5. 3rd Party Ads 
Google and other third-party vendors, uses cookies to serve ads. These cookies enable them to serve 
ads to visitors based on their visit to sites they visit on the internet. Website visitors may opt out of the 
use of these 3rd party cookies by visiting the 3rd party vendors and following their instructions for 
removal. 

6. Children 
The service is intended for audiences who are 14 years or older. The service is not intended for children 
13 or younger. We do not knowingly collect personal information from children under 14. 

If you become aware that a child has provided us with personal information without parental consent, 
please contact us. If we become aware that a child under 14 has provided us with personal information 
without parental consent, we will take steps to remove such information and terminate the child's 
account. 


